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companies active in various industry sectors, which are listed in the brochure "NPM
Capital in Business 2012“ (please note that in 2012 NPM has divested its participations in
Bol.com and Plasticum Group), which we attach as  Appendix  1. For further information
on NPM and its activities, the Parties refer to www.n m-ca ital.nl.

3.1.2  SHV

SHV is the holding company of a group of companies which are active globally. Besides
NPM, the current activities of SHV consist of:

SHV Energy  which is active in the field of LPG trade and distribution. It is present in the
market through a range of fully owned majority interests in LPG companies. Well-known
brand names include Primagaz, Calor Gas, Liqulgas, Super Gas, Ipragas, Supergasbras,
Gaspol, Probugas and Butan Plin.

Makro which is active in the field of cash and carry wholesale of food and non-food
products.

Mammoet  which is active in the field of heavy lifting and transport, it provides services to
the petrochemical, power generation, civil engineering and offshore sectors.

ERIKS  which is engaged in the supply of high-quality mechanical engineering
components and associated technical and logistics services.

Dyas which invests in joint ventures in oil and gas exploration, development and
production, Dyas acts as a non-operator, with a primary focus on the North Sea.

For further information on SHV and an overview of its most important direct and indirect
subsidiaries, the Parties refer to www.shv.nl. More detailed information on SHV can also
be found in SHV's Financial Report for the business year 2011, attached as Appendix 2.

3.2 Driesprong and VSI

3.2.1 Driesprong

Driesprong is a Dutch company with a number of subsidiaries, one of them is VSI
(described in more details below). The Driesprong group perform different activities, but
except for VSI none of the companies had turnover in 2011. An outline of the Driesprong
company group is attached as Confidential Appendix 3.

The different companies' business activities are:

Crisp Sensation  and  participations  develop and exploit IP for preparation of crumbed
snacks for the oven and microwave instead of frying pan (for further information see site
www.crispsensation.com)

Residence Beheer Hi/versum BV is only a financing company.

Magsnack BV is an empty company.

Intelligent Food Solutions BV does research, development and advice of food techniques.

Jamin Winkelbedrijf BV is franchisor of Jamin shops which is a chain of confectionery
stores that provides candies and nuts.

Driesprong Finance BV is only a financing company

Driesprong Management BV is an internal management and service company.

Fortezza Security Systems BV is a supplier of security systems and solutions.
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7. PUBLIC  ACCESS

This notification contains business secrets. All business secrets are marked in the text in
double underiined format. Some of the appendices do also contain business secrets, and
these are marked as confidential.

We kindly ask the Competition Authority to contact us should any third party require
access to the notification and that we are contacted before access is granted.

Yours sincerely
Advokatfirmaet Wiersholm AS
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